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Pharmacology department of BUMDC organized
“Students Activity 2016” for the 5th consecutive year
since 2012 for 3rd year MBBS and 2nd year BDS students
with the mission to utilize conventional as well as
modern gadgets for teaching students.
Vice Admiral (Retd) Tahseen Ullah Khan HI (M),
Director General BUMDC graced the occasion as chief
guest. Prof. Dr. Shaheen Moin, Principal and Dean
Health Sciences, Prof. Dr. Zubair Ahmed Abbasi,
Principal Dental Section, faculty members and students
attended the event.
The event comprised of two components a quiz
competition and an exhibition on the subject theme of
“Pharmacokinetics and Pharmacodynamics”.
Animations, video lectures and news update galleries
were part of this exhibition. The event started with
recitation of Quranic verses by Hafiz Ali Arsalan(3rd

year MBBS student). Dr. Talea Hoor hosted the event.
Prof. Dr. Nasim Karim delivered the welcome address
and briefed the audience regarding the event. Quiz
competition was conducted with three participating
teams in the final round (each having 5 members). They
were selected out of 150 students after passing through
a number of qualifying rounds. This task was assigned
to and accomplished with great efforts by Dr. Khalid
Mustafa, Dr. Ijaz Hussain and Dr. Tanveer Ahmed. Team
C (Sharmeen Junejo, Sara Rabbani, Sara Jamil, Sana
Sainch and Najam-us-Sahar) won the quiz and was
awarded trophy and individual medals. Judges of the
event Prof. Dr. Iqbal Udaipurwala and Prof. Dr. Sajid
Abbas Jafri were given shields. Certificates were given
to Tahira Khan (BDS), Sara Riaz (MBBS), and Ali
Usman (MBBS) for maximum participation in
animations, videos and news update categories
respectively. Javed Ahmed and Nisha Devi (MBBS),
Tooba Kamran, Hansa Bai, Sara Jamil and FaizaShafi
(BDS) were awarded with runner up certificates.Ali
Arsalan was given certificate for qirat. Sara Abbasi (4th

year MBBS volunteer) received certificate for preparing
backdrop and standees for the event. Usman Habib (2nd

year), Syed Mohammad Rameez (4th year) and Syed
UmerFarooq (final year) MBBS, volunteers were given
certificates for video making and photography of the
event.  Shield of “Outstanding Student Performance”
was awarded to Ali Usman (3rd year MBBS). Faculty
and staff members of Pharmacology were awarded with
shields for supervising the students.
Director General and Principal BUMDC in their remarks
for the occasion appreciated the leadership of Prof. Dr.
Nasim Karim, HOD Pharmacology and coherent effort
of her entire team. Memento of the event was
Presented to Director General, Principal BUMDC and
Principal Dental Section.
The exhibition was declared open for the visitors there
after. Video gallery included 42 video lectures. This task
was assigned to and supervised with dedication by Dr.
Tahira Zameer, Dr. Tauseef Sayyar and Dr. Madiha
Nisar. Animation gallery had 400 contributions being
supervised and displayed with great responsibility by
Dr. Riffat Farooqi and Dr. Afsheen Nazar. News update
gallery comprised of 50 news updates of 2015 and 2016.
This innovative corner was the work assigned to and
done with sincerity by Dr. Talea Hoor, Dr.Mehtab Munir
and Dr. Ayesha Khan.
Vote of thanks was delivered by Dr. Riffat Farooqi and
the event ended with the pledge by the Pharmacology
Department to continue such yearly academic activities
for the students in future.
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